
Trade Package Bidder 
Called/Confirmed Bidding 5 days prior 

to bid

Scope Review Accept 
or Reject and Reason Base Bid

Alternate-1 
NVCC Faculty 

Space

Alternate #2 
Multipurpose 

Room

Alternate #3 
Surgical Tech 

Suite
With Alt.-1 With Alt.-1-2 With Alt.-1-3

PACKAGE #1
Site Work, Site Conc. Site Specialties

All State Construction, Inc No bid submitted
Colossale Concrete, Inc. No bid submitted
H.I. Stone & Son, Inc. Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $2,009,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,009,000.00 $2,009,000.00 $2,009,000.00
John J Brennan (site work only) No bid submitted
Mizzy Construction, Inc. No bid submitted
Richards Corporation No bid submitted
Nagy Bros.Construction No bid submitted
DeRita Construction Co., Inc. No bid submitted
Richards Corporation No bid submitted
Xenelis Construction Co., Inc. No bid submitted
J Iapaluccio $2,588,000.00 $2,588,000.00 $2,588,000.00 $2,588,000.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00

PACKAGE #2
Demolition and Abatement $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Abcon Enviromental No bid submitted Re-Bid
Cherry Hill Demolition No bid submitted Re-Bid
American Environmental inc No bid submitted Re-Bid
Haz-Pros Inc. No bid submitted Re-Bid
John J Brennan No bid submitted Re-Bid
New England Yankee Construction, LLC No bid submitted Re-Bid
Nosal Builders No bid submitted Re-Bid
Bestech Inc. No bid submitted Re-Bid
Southern Middlesex Industries, Inc. No bid submitted Re-Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00

PACKAGE #3 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Landscaping $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

OWI Contractors No bid submitted
Country Gardens of Bristol, Inc. No bid submitted
Lenares Landscape No bid submitted
EDI Landscaping Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $19,560.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $19,560.00 $19,560.00 $19,560.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00

PACKAGE #4 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Concrete $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Connecticut Concrete Constructon No bid submitted
RJB Contracting, Inc. $1,769,700.00 $1,769,700.00 $1,769,700.00 $1,769,700.00

Bid scope for demolition and abatement was greatly reduced and 
bidders in general did not pursue.
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Structural Preservation Systems LLC No bid submitted
Hop River Concrete Rejected No DAS Form $1,584,000.00 $1,584,000.00 $1,584,000.00 $1,584,000.00
Ultimate Concrete No bid submitted

Waterbury Masons & Foundations

Pending Confirmation of 
Underpin Engineering

$1,723,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,723,000.00 $1,723,000.00 $1,723,000.00
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00

PACKAGE #5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Masonry $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Marquis Masonry LLC No bid submitted
Mid-State Mason Contractors, Inc. $3,240,000.00 $3,240,000.00 $3,240,000.00 $3,240,000.00
Noble Construction & Management, Inc. $3,710,000.00 $3,710,000.00 $3,710,000.00 $3,710,000.00
Lombardo Bros. Masonry, LLC No bid submitted
NER Construction No bid submitted
Sunrise Masonry No bid submitted
Fernandes Masonry, Inc. $2,963,500.00 $2,963,500.00 $2,963,500.00 $2,963,500.00
Civitillo Masonry* Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $2,946,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,946,000.00 $2,946,000.00 $2,946,000.00
Joe Capasso Masons* No bid submitted

PACKAGE #6 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Structural Steel $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

General Welding and Fabrication* Rejected Scope Errors $1,705,500.00 $0.00 $20,000.00 $0.00 $1,705,500.00 $1,725,500.00 $1,725,500.00
ProIron No bid submitted
QSR Steel* No bid submitted
Shepard Steel* Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $1,827,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,827,000.00 $1,827,000.00 $1,827,000.00
Steeltech* No bid submitted
United Steel* No bid submitted
All Phase Steel Works No bid submitted
Connecticut Carpentry Corporation No bid submitted
Eastern Steel Erectors, LLC No bid submitted
Erection & Welding Rejected Scope Errors $1,291,600.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,291,600.00 $1,291,600.00 $1,291,600.00

PACKAGE #7
Miscellaneous Metals

All Phase Steel Works No bid submitted
Connecticut Carpentry Corporation No bid submitted
General Welding and Fabrication* $518,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $518,000.00 $518,000.00 $518,000.00
ProIron Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $515,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $515,000.00 $515,000.00 $515,000.00
Shepard Steel No bid submitted
Erection & Welding $681,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $681,500.00 $681,500.00 $681,500.00

PACKAGE #8
General Trades/Drywall

Bismark Construction Company, Inc. No bid submitted
Connecticut Carpentry Corporation No bid submitted
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ENFIELD BUILDERS INC. No bid submitted
Garsan Construction Inc Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $3,754,000.00 $256,000.00 $300,000.00 $25,000.00 $4,010,000.00 $4,310,000.00 $4,335,000.00
OWI Contractors, LLC No bid submitted
GDS Contracting Corp. $5,118,400.00 $136,600.00 $231,000.00 $25,000.00 $5,255,000.00 $5,486,000.00 $5,511,000.00
Nosal Builders $4,389,400.00 $193,500.00 $304,900.00 $102,000.00 $4,582,900.00 $4,887,800.00 $4,989,800.00
Noble Construction & Management, Inc. $4,490,000.00 $215,000.00 $243,000.00 $54,000.00 $4,705,000.00 $4,948,000.00 $5,002,000.00
Scope Construction Company, Inc. $3,792,000.00 $174,000.00 $284,000.00 $54,000.00 $3,966,000.00 $4,250,000.00 $4,304,000.00

PACKAGE #9
Acoustical Ceilings

N.T. Oliva, Inc. $314,500.00 $27,300.00 $12,800.00 $4,200.00 $341,800.00 $354,600.00 $358,800.00
Central CT Acoustics* $322,000.00 $30,000.00 $12,200.00 $4,800.00 $352,000.00 $364,200.00 $369,000.00
Conn Acoustics* No bid submitted
Acoustics Inc.* $311,400.00 $25,760.00 $11,900.00 $2,700.00 $337,160.00 $349,060.00 $351,760.00
Yumbla $455,000.00 $52,000.00 $12,000.00 $7,500.00 $507,000.00 $519,000.00 $526,500.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Drywall Techniques Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $292,900.00 $24,500.00 $12,000.00 $5,000.00 $317,400.00 $329,400.00 $334,400.00

PACKAGE #10
Flooring LVT,VCT,Carpet,Mats

M. Frank Higgins* $410,500.00 $27,000.00 $25,700.00 $5,260.00 $437,500.00 $463,200.00 $468,460.00
Joseph Cohn Flooring No bid submitted
Barall & Kover Floors* Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $265,235.00 $28,294.00 $20,456.00 $4,105.00 $293,529.00 $313,985.00 $318,090.00
Urban Contractors No bid submitted
Commercial Flooring Concepts, Inc. No bid submitted
Spectrum Floors $284,777.00 $19,965.00 $21,430.00 $3,865.00 $304,742.00 $326,172.00 $330,037.00
R&B Ceramic $318,000.00 $28,000.00 $20,000.00 $5,500.00 $346,000.00 $366,000.00 $371,500.00

PACKAGE #11
Painting

Pro-Tect of CT No bid submitted
Professional Painting Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $134,200.00 $12,700.00 $7,200.00 $1,700.00 $146,900.00 $154,100.00 $155,800.00
Mackenzie Painting Company/Mackenzie Service Corp $146,940.00 $9,600.00 $6,440.00 $1,650.00 $156,540.00 $162,980.00 $164,630.00
Nosal Drywall & Painting No bid submitted
Roberge Painting No bid submitted
Total Interiors No bid submitted

PACKAGE #12
Flooring Stone/Resinous

Commercial Flooring Concepts No bid submitted
M Frank Higgins $598,198.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $598,198.00 $598,198.00 $598,198.00
joseph cohen Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $447,385.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $447,385.00 $447,385.00 $447,385.00
Barral & Kover No bid submitted
R&B Ceramic $483,700.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $483,700.00 $483,700.00 $483,700.00
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PACKAGE #13
Signage

Custom Sign Solution No bid submitted
Sign-Lite No bid submitted
ABC Signs No bid submitted
Connecticut Carpentry Corporation Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $139,375.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $139,375.00 $139,375.00 $139,375.00

PACKAGE #14
Roofing

A. Secondino & Son, Inc. No bid submitted
Allied Construction $682,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $682,000.00 $682,000.00 $682,000.00
Barrett Roofing $878,727.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $878,727.00 $878,727.00 $878,727.00
Gold Seal Roofing & Sheetmetal, Inc $598,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $598,000.00 $598,000.00 $598,000.00
Greenwood Industries, Inc. $592,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $592,000.00 $592,000.00 $592,000.00
Hartford Restoration Services Inc. No bid submitted
Silktown Roofing Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $585,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $585,000.00 $585,000.00 $585,000.00
Quality Roofing $633,700.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $633,700.00 $633,700.00 $633,700.00

PACKAGE #15
Windows, Curtainwall, Glass and Glaze

A. Secondino & Son, Inc. No bid submitted
Cherry Hill Glass* Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $1,685,770.00 $39,715.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,725,485.00 $1,725,485.00 $1,725,485.00
Massey Plate and Glass* $2,038,000.00 $61,667.00 $4,365.00 $7,278.00 $2,099,667.00 $2,104,032.00 $2,111,310.00
Accurate Door & Window L.L.C. $1,856,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,856,000.00 $1,856,000.00 $1,856,000.00
Commercial Storefront Services, Inc No bid submitted

PACKAGE #16
Final Cleaning

Advanced Cleaning Concepts No bid submitted
Advantage Cleaning, LLC Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $46,790.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $46,790.00 $46,790.00 $46,790.00
Horizon services corp No bid submitted
Professional General Cleaning LLC No bid submitted
Orissa LLC No Bid Docs submitted-Rejected $90,200.00 $4,430.00 $2,457.00 $975.00 $94,630.00 $97,087.00 $98,062.00

PACKAGE #17
Toilet Partitions & Accessories

CT Restrooms No bid submitted
Steeltech $128,745.00 $1,467.00 $0.00 $0.00 $130,212.00 $130,212.00 $130,212.00
Elite Construction Rentals $87,500.00 $750.00 $135.00 $260.00 $88,250.00 $88,385.00 $88,645.00
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Connecticut Carpentry Corporation $105,813.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $105,813.00 $105,813.00 $105,813.00
Scope Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $81,900.00 $725.00 $0.00 $0.00 $82,625.00 $82,625.00 $82,625.00
Killcourse $95,060.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $95,060.00 $95,060.00 $95,060.00

PACKAGE #18
Window Treatments

Elite Construction Rentals No bid submitted
Draperies Inc. No bid submitted
Harbor Linen No bid submitted
Walch & Company No bid submitted
Connecticut Carpentry Corp Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $122,374.00 $18,269.00 $16,845.00 $3,684.00 $140,643.00 $157,488.00 $161,172.00

PACKAGE #19
Flooring-Ceramic Tile

Apex Tile LLC Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $125,000.00 $5,700.00 $0.00 $0.00 $130,700.00 $130,700.00 $130,700.00
R&B Ceramic Tile & Flooring* $164,000.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $171,500.00 $171,500.00 $171,500.00
Atlantic Masonry* $140,588.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $140,588.00 $140,588.00 $140,588.00
Joseph Cohen $176,502.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $176,502.00 $176,502.00 $176,502.00
M frank higgin $139,362.00 $49,820.00 $0.00 $0.00 $189,182.00 $189,182.00 $189,182.00
Specrum $144,666.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $144,666.00 $144,666.00 $144,666.00

PACKAGE #20
Fire Protection

S.R.I. FIRE SPRINKLER, LLC $398,500.00 $10,600.00 $13,400.00 $2,100.00 $409,100.00 $422,500.00 $424,600.00
H.H.S. Mechanical Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $325,000.00 $21,000.00 $16,000.00 $2,000.00 $346,000.00 $362,000.00 $364,000.00
MJ Daly* $364,000.00 $12,000.00 $15,000.00 $0.00 $376,000.00 $391,000.00 $391,000.00
Wolverine Fire Protection Company $368,700.00 $12,000.00 $20,000.00 $0.00 $380,700.00 $400,700.00 $400,700.00
K&M Fire Protection $329,170.00 $10,000.00 $14,000.00 $1,200.00 $339,170.00 $353,170.00 $354,370.00

PACKAGE #21
Plumbing

J&B Mechanical Contractors, LLC No bid submitted
DiRenzo Mechanical* Rejected No DAS Form $985,262.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $985,262.00 $985,262.00 $985,262.00
P & D Mechanical, Inc. $1,678,000.00 $28,500.00 $49,657.00 $31,200.00 $1,706,500.00 $1,756,157.00 $1,787,357.00
Performance Plumbing & Heating LLC No bid submitted
Southport Contracting $1,299,000.00 $11,500.00 $27,000.00 $9,500.00 $1,310,500.00 $1,337,500.00 $1,347,000.00
Eastern Energy Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $1,144,000.00 $7,000.00 $12,000.00 $8,000.00 $1,151,000.00 $1,163,000.00 $1,171,000.00

PACKAGE #22
HVAC

DiRenzo Mechanical* No bid submitted
Stewart Mechanical* $6,543,370.00 $158,000.00 $131,000.00 $49,000.00 $6,701,370.00 $6,832,370.00 $6,881,370.00
All State Construction, Inc No bid submitted
P & D Mechanical, Inc. Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $6,130,000.00 $123,000.00 $105,000.00 $55,000.00 $6,253,000.00 $6,358,000.00 $6,413,000.00



Trade Package Bidder 
Called/Confirmed Bidding 5 days prior 

to bid

Scope Review Accept 
or Reject and Reason Base Bid

Alternate-1 
NVCC Faculty 

Space

Alternate #2 
Multipurpose 

Room

Alternate #3 
Surgical Tech 

Suite
With Alt.-1 With Alt.-1-2 With Alt.-1-3

Ferguson No bid submitted
Performance Plumbing & Heating LLC No bid submitted
Eastern Energy $6,197,000.00 $117,000.00 $108,000.00 $38,000.00 $6,314,000.00 $6,422,000.00 $6,460,000.00

PACKAGE #23
Electrical

A&R Electric bid arrived late and was not accepted
Semac Electric $2,834,460.00 $44,535.00 $56,250.00 $9,466.00 $2,878,995.00 $2,935,245.00 $2,944,711.00
C & H Electric, Inc $2,748,000.00 $92,800.00 $91,300.00 $20,200.00 $2,840,800.00 $2,932,100.00 $2,952,300.00
Electrical Contractors, Inc. $3,124,000.00 $110,600.00 $74,900.00 $16,200.00 $3,234,600.00 $3,309,500.00 $3,325,700.00
Beacon Electric $3,328,250.00 $159,430.00 $160,890.00 $8,200.00 $3,487,680.00 $3,648,570.00 $3,656,770.00
Electrical Services Group No bid submitted
JE Shea Electrical No bid submitted
Ferguson Rejected Scope Errors $2,727,000.00 $74,900.00 $68,700.00 $14,700.00 $2,801,900.00 $2,870,600.00 $2,885,300.00
Wayne J Grifnn $2,889,000.00 $99,200.00 $69,600.00 $8,950.00 $2,988,200.00 $3,057,800.00 $3,066,750.00

PACKAGE #24
Fire Alarm

Beacon Electric Accepted Scope & Bid Docs. $319,432.00 $24,283.00 $6,685.00 $3,284.00 $343,715.00 $350,400.00 $353,684.00
C&H Electric $358,000.00 $8,400.00 $29,300.00 $2,000.00 $366,400.00 $395,700.00 $397,700.00
Ferguson No bid submitted
Electrical Services Group $342,357.00 $19,858.00 $9,122.00 $1,255.00 $362,215.00 $371,337.00 $372,592.00

PACKAGE #25
Elevator

Kone Elevator No bid submitted
Otis No bid submitted
Bay State Elevator No bid submitted

PACKAGE #26
Firestopping

Advanced Caulking & Restoration No bid submitted
Barber Firestopping Called day of bid said did not have time

All these packages will be re-
bid.  Low bidder did not 
have the tele/data cabling 

and claimed was given verbal 
instructions not to carry.


	NVCC Bid Results 11-13-14

